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SITUATION VACANT NOTICE

BUSINESS

SITUATION WANTED

SENIOR ACCOUNTANT with 16 years of Experience in 
(Construction Co, Manufacturing Co, Oil & Gas, Hotel 
Industry, Hospital) can do Finalization, Payroll, Accounts 
Receivable & Payables, Bank Reconciliation,  Leave   
settlement, Gratuity, LC & Bank Guarantees. Contact: 
71214854, email: getsalman643@gmail.com

FINANCE MANAGER/CHIEF ACCOUNTANT/senior 
accountant qualification MBA Finance, M.Com. B.Com 
experience 24 years including (GCC UAE 15 Years) 
experienced with different nature of business accounting 
and ERP softwares. Proficient in financial strategies, 
cash flow, fund flow, management, financial reporting, 
treasures, budgeting and auditing upto finalisation with 
NOC Email: mafazeel@yahoo.com contact#31645319.

ACCOUNTANT/SENIOR ACCOUNTANT-Indian Male. 
Bachelor degree in accounting with 9 year experience in 
Qatar. Ability to work accounts up to finalization, Banking, 
AP, AR,GL Reconciliation,Cash flow,Budgeting,Petty 
Cash, WPS, monthly report etc. proficiency in SAP B1, 
Sage, Tally etc Transferable Visa with NOC & Qatar 
Driving License. Can join immediately. Contact: 
31430335. Email:muhammedbasheerpkd@gmail.com

FINANCE MANAGER / CHIEF ACCOUNTANT - Indian 
Male. M.B.A. Finance + CMA (pursuing) with 13+ years’ 
experience (medical & hospitality) in Qatar. Proficient in 
Financial & Management Reporting, Cash Flow, 
Budgeting, cost control, Procurement, Finalization of 
accounts and Payroll. Expertise in ERP softwares. 
Having Qatar driving license with transferable QID and 
NOC. Contact: 55112762, Email: jobij3@gmail.com

QUANTITY SURVEYOR Srilankan Male, BSc Quantity 
Surveying with 3 years experience in pre&post contract 
of civil&structural works. Knowledge on AutoCAD Revit 
and Planswift. Valid QID with NOC and can join 
immediately. Contact: 71472043 Email: ims.
muhammathu.qs@gmail.com

ADMINISTRATIVE SPECIALIST/HR Assistant (Indian 
Female) 14 years proven expertise primarily in the 
education sector including GCC exposure. B.Com, MBA 
(pursuing) locally available under husband's sponsorship, 
and having valid Qatar Driving license, ready to join 
immediately. Contact: 70943533 / sanidhasumod@gmail.
com.

HR / ADMIN / SALES COORDINATOR: With over 3 years 
of experience in HR, Admin, and Sales Coordination in 
Qatar, I am currently looking for a job under Husband 
Sponsorship. Available to start immediately. Please 
contact me at +77114462 or via email at indiradevi.
rajesh@gmail.com

KENYAN(FEMALE) patient care assistant: Diploma in 
health and social care and nursing of Ireland,Galway city. 
Having three years experience in private hospital in 
Qatar. Seeking for a job as a nurse assistant. Qid and 
Noc available. Contact +97450935140, Email 
njokiemmah800@gmail.com

PROCUREMENT MANAGER/Senior Procurement 
Specialist,17 years experience in Qatar,versed in Ashghal 
projects,Civil,Fitout,MEP, Building construction,Turnkey 
projects,Infrastructure,Supply chain,Oracle,Microsoft 
Office and Preparing POs & Contracts. NOC is available. 
Contact 50149488 - ahmedshabana390@gmail.com

QCDD AND UPDA CERTIFIED Mechanical Engineer with 
over 5 years of experience in MEP and fire fighting 
estimation. Seeking positions that prioritize on-site 
involvement. Holds a Qatar driving license and is ready 
to join immediately. Contact: 55277594, Email: 
ccmubasheer@gmail.com

SALES ASSOCIATE / OFFICE STAFF (Female-
Philippines) Total 8 Years in Qatar, Experiences as Store 
In Charge, Senior Sales Associate, have excellent 
communication skills,fast learner and team leader, Can 
do office related and Knowledgeable in Ms office, Excel 
and Email Outlook ready to join immediately With 
transferable visa and NOC. Contact No: 31431336 Email 
Add: missyhan10@yahoo.com

SRILANKAN MALE TAILOR 15 years experience with 5 
years GCC seeking job as a tailor with valid QID, can join 
Immediately M/b No 71429791 Email: masboothmh@
gmail.com

ADMIN OFFICER / HR ADMIN / PROCUREMENT 
OFFICER- I have BBM degree with 4 years experiences. 
Looking for a suitable opportunities. QID with transferable 
visa available. Ready to join immediately. Contact: 
71924463. Email: abrees123@gmail.com

SENIOR CIVIL ENGINEER Construction/Project Manager 
with UPDA Grade A, 20 Years Experience in Qatar For 
Construction All Types of Buildings, Fit-out and Ashghal 
Projects, Having Qatar Driving License, NOC, Also Can 
Help for Upgrading Contracting Company And Consulting 
offices. Contact: 55578994, Email: abdelalim2200@
gmail.com

HR & ADMIN-MALE: an Indian National with 10 years’ 
experience in HR in Qatar (Employee relations, 
performance Review, ERP, Onboarding Exit formalities, 
documentation etc..) Holds valid QID and ready to Join 
Immediately. Please contact: 55840346, email : 
cjyothish@gmail.com

QUANTITY SURVEYOR/ CIVIL ENGINEER, filipino 15 
years GCC Experience in Pre/ Post Contract of Civil, 
Structural, Architectural Finishing & Fit Out Works and 
can join immediately. Contact 70612750, n o r o g a e r @
gmail.com

LIGHT DRIVER/ MECHANIC Having 15 years experience 
with valid light driver licence. manual and automatic and 
a skilled mechanic looking for suitable job. With valid 
QID. Contact 33237336, samero5259@gmail.com

ELECTRICAL ENGINEER(MEP) with 9 years of 
experience in Qatar working in construction firms in 
diverse building services and infrastructure projects 
including WOQOD petrol station and Shell projects. 
Expertise in project execution, QA/QC , T & C and 
handing over of electrical services (HV,LV,ELV). 
Transferable visa with NOC. Contact 71154621, 
arunvilayil2544@gmail.com

HR MANAGER / HR SUPERVISOR: MBA, 10+ years 
experience. Good in all HR Functions like recruitment, 
payroll, policies, C& B management, ERP implementation 
training coordinations, ER, QLL, Settlements, onboarding 
and offboarding, etc. Qatar Driving license holder + QID 
with NOC. Please contact seekjob990@gmail.com, 
50048755.

SENIOR OR CHIEF ACCOUNTANT / Finance Manager: 
Indian Male (Bcom) having 17 years experience in GCC. 
In financial accounting. Experts in GL, AP, AR Banking, 
Budgeting, WPS and Finalisation. Sound knowledge of 
ERP, Peachtree and Tally. Having Qatar Driving License 
with NOC of Transferable Visa. Contact: 66179631, 
Email: saji123pm@gmail.com

HR & ADMIN MANAGER with 16 years of expertise. 
Proficient in performance management, talent acquisition 
and international recruitment, as well as C&B 
administration.  An  ISO certified lead auditor, TOT, 
Scaffolding and  food inspector.  Expert in policies and 
procedures along with comprehensive knowledge of 
Qatar labour laws, WPS, facilities management, camp & 
catering operations and transport management.  Contact: 
77581007, Email. jaisher8@gmail.com

SENIOR SAFETY SUPERVISOR / Fire Safety & 
Emergency Coordinator: With 14 Years Work Experience 
in Road, Building and facility management. Degree in 
Economics, NEBOSH Fire & Risk Management , IOSH, 
Lead Auditor, NEBOSH IGC, Authorized Gas tester, 
Scaffolding Certificates and with valid Qatar driver’s 
license. I am Looking for a job. Contact: 30160574, 
email: somsafetysupervisor@gmail.com

POST GRADUATE in logistics and supply chain 
management with more than a year of Business 
Development sales experience. I have both QID and 
Driving license. Looking for opportunities to leverage my 
skills and to contribute to a growing company. Contact: 
70332957, email: jeswin01998@gmail.com

LOGISTICS ASSISTANT / Customer service / Operations 
/ Logistics Admin. Indian lady under husband's 
sponsorship seeking suitable opportunities in any 
industry. Have 3 years experience in logistics in Qatar. 
Ready to join immediately. Contact: 55373960, Email id: 
krishnaindira26@gmail.com

INDIAN MALE 42 B.COM with 18 years Experience (15 
years in Doha) Responsible for oversight of day-to-day 
finance and accounting operations (GL, AR, AP, 
Banking,Project Cost, Budgeting, Cash flow, WPS, MIS, 
FS Finalization. Proficient in  MS office,ERP Tally and 
Delta software’s. Can join immediately. Having Qatar 
Driving License, transferable work visa with NOC. 
Contact: 70409024, email: imbichidoha@gmail.com

A HSE PROFESSIONAL Needs a long term placement, 
Certified in OHS level 6 Diploma, IGC NEBOSH, ISO 
45001 Lead Auditor, QWZTMG ,AGT, and FIRST AID; 10 
years gulf experience in various oil & gas, facility 
management and other infrastructural construction 
projects. NOC with transferable visa, I will make your 
organisation safer & more sustainable. Contact: 
50034657, email: gloriousgr8@gmail.com

SENIOR ACCOUNTANT with 9 years of experience in 
Accounts & Audit. Proficient in all accounting aspects 
including Finalisation,AP,AR,GL,Budget, Variance 
Analysis,Forecasting, Cashflow Management, Cost 
Control, Audit, WPS, and ICV. Proficiency in ERP 
including Oodo,Peachtree,Tally, & Advance in MS Excel.
Education: Chartered Accountancy-Inter, Bachelor 
Degree in Finance. Having NOC and Qatar Driving 
Licence. Contact: 66714313, email: mhdriyaz007@
gmail.com

ADMIN JOBS / COLLECTION OFFICER / Indoor Sales 
Support. Filipina With Years of Experience in 
Manufacturing & Trading Companies In Qatar.  With 
Good Communication Skills, Self Driven And Team 
Player. Proficient In Ms Office.  Can Join Immediately 
With Transferable Visa, NOC and Qatar Driving License. 
Email: charo2013.ch@gmail.com / Mobile: 66061529.

OFFICE ASSISTANT: Indian national lady looking for job 
as teacher assistant, day care provider or babysitter. 
Available immediately under husband sponsorship. For 
more details, please contact me at 55605933, 55605933, 
mariaa.dsouza17@gmail.com

ESTIMATION ENGINEER (MECHANICAL). UPDA / 
MMUP Registered, Graduated Mechanical Engineer with 
over 10 years of industry expertise in MEP and Building 
services across diverse sectors including residential and 
commercial building, infrastructure, Oil and Gas projects 
etc. Seeking for a challenging opportunity in estimation, 
procurement and cost control. Currently available with 
transferable visa and NOC. Contact: 77304620, email: 
suhail4kl@gmail.com

INDIAN CIVIL ENGINEER 15 years of experience as 
Senior civil engineer, QA/QC Engineer, Structural 
engineer, Interior engineer, Landscaping engineer, 
Estimation engineer and Project manager. Worked at 
UAE, Saudi, Kuwait, Qatar and India in various field as in 
senior position read to work and join immediately with 
valid QID transferable. Contact: 71732735, email: 
sabahomes2010@gmail.com

LOOKING FOR A POSITION in Marketing or Customer 
Service*Sri Lankan male with over 12 years of experience 
in Qatar Airways and telecommunication sectors. 
Extensive background in customer service and marketing, 
including supervisory roles. Ready to join immediately 
with a transferable visa and NOC. Contact 71471621, 
ajinfb@yahoo.com

HSE PROFESSIONAL/MANAGER/ENGINEER  for Over 
15 Years Working Experience In Civil Construction, High 
Rise Building, Infrastructure, And Consulting Firm With 
12 Years Experience In Qatar And Strong Knowledge of 
QCS 2014. BSc Economics Level 6 NVQ, CMIOSH, 
NEBOSH IGC, 30HR OSHA, IOSH MS, ISO 45001 Lead 
Auditor Certified.  Email: mac_murando@yahoo.com        
/ Mobile: 31220446 / 33397314.

ADMINISTRATION, HR, PERSONAL ASSISTANT, Sri 
Lankan female, 6 years of experience in Administration 
and Human Resources divisions and well experienced as 
a Personal Assistant to high - profile executives. Well 
versed in entire HR functions, Recruitment, Employee 
relations. Proficient in MS-Word, Excel, Powerpoint. 
Looking for suitable opportunities. Ready to join 
immediately. Valid QID with NOC. Contact: 33814374, 
email: misili2024qtr@gmail.com

ACCOUNTANT / ASSISTANT ACCOUNTANT. Sri Lankan 
male with BBA Degree in finance having 4 years work 
experience in all accounting related duties up to 
finalization (AP, AR, Bookkeeping, Payroll, GL, Banking, 
etc…) ability to adopt to any ERP system looking for 
suitable position, QID with NOC. Mobile: 71310284, 
Email: shakirm125@gmail.com

SPECIAL EDUCATION TEACHER: Indian Female, 
holding special education degree (B.Ed) & Rehabilitation 
certificate with 6 Years of Teaching experience, looking 
for suitable position to join immediately in Qatar, Having 
valid QID. Contact details:  Mobile: 33938121, Email: 
danishmomin801@gmail.com

SITE ENGINEER (CIVIL . ARCH ). QA/QC. Having 8 years 
of experience in different Engineering Field, Specialized 
in structure & Finishing/Fit out Projects. Transferable visa 
and ready to join immediately. Looking for suitable 
opportunities. Contact: 77251072, email: urbaintiti9@
gmail.com

CHIEF/SENIOR ACCOUNTANT, ACCOUNTANT, Indian, 
10+ Years experience, Mcom, Bcom, Finalisation, 
Budgeting, Trend Analysis, Comparative Financial 
Statements, Current Ratio, Creditworthiness, Solvency, 
Changes in Working capital, Shareholders Funds, 
Control over Bank facilities, Fund Management, Valid 
QID and NOC available. Kindly contact : 50390444, 
66134735 & sudheer.mail2@gmail.com

TEACHER WITH EXPERIENCE in Qatar as Science / 
Chemistry teacher/ Science Coordinator . Looking for a 
job opportunity Ready to join immediately with valid 
Qatar ID ( family sponsorship ) Mobile number :55438521 
Email ID: jubeena.2023@gmail.com

SALES COORDINATOR/Application engineer/Document 
controller Education:-B.T EEE Experience:- Has 4 years 
of experience in business development team for 
preparing Quotation,tenders Sales support. Contact 
31564389, barnikalasowjanya@gmail.com

ADMINISTRATIVE ASSISTANT/HR RECRUITMENT 
ASSISTANT/AIRPORT GROUND HANDLING -Indian 
female with MA in English and Diploma in Hospitality 
Travel and Customer service with more than 3 years of 
experience and 6 months Qatar Experience as 
Administrative assistant, Recruitment Assistant, 
Customer relations etc. Proficient in MS office, 
Documentation, Admin roles. Having valid QID and can 
join immediately. Contact: +974 55185646, Email: 
drishya848@gmail.com

INDIAN MALE CIVIL CARPENTER Charge hand, with 
more than 6 years’ experience, in Middle East and Qatar, 
looking for new job in Infrastructure, Commercial building 
and Villa constructions. NOC and transferable visa. 
Ready to join immediately. Mob.: 31658821 Email: 
ashrafali462@gmail.com

ACCOUNTS ASSISTANT (Indian female) With 8 years of 
experience in Qatar. Valid Qid with driving license. Also 
having 5 years experience in administrative assistant. 
Knowledge in MS office and tally. Ready to join 
immediately. Contact 33410292, emiliaajo@gmail.com

ASSISTANT FACILITY MANAGER with more than 11 
years of Job Experience having: University Degree   
(B.Sc), CFM, ISO 9001: 2015, OSHA 132 hours seeking 
a job placement in a well reputable organisation. NOC 
Available & Ready to Transfer. Contact: 70433682, 
email: eunicedoha2018@yahoo.com

ACCOUNTANT / SENIOR ACCOUNTANT. Sri Lankan 
male having 9 years of experience. Having a Degree in 
Accounting and Finance. Reading masters and ACCA. 
Experience up to final accounts. Immediately available. 
NOC Available. Contact: 66469057, email: inshaf95@
gmail.com

FINANCE CONSULTANT, Indian Male for Auditing, 
Taxation & Accounts, 17 years experience in Doha Qatar, 
looking for Full-time/Part-time Job. Mobile: 55994491, 
Email id: itp_stp@yahoo.com

LOGISTIC COORDINATOR / Fleet Coordinator: MCA 
postgraduate with 3 years experience in logistics field 
with transferable visa and NOC. Companies believe in 
ability and attitude can contact me. Skills can be studied. 
Email: basilrajuvdy@gmail.com / Ph: 77937122.

EXPERIENCED ARCHITECT, interior designer, site 
engineer, and recently project manager with 8 years of 
expertise in consultancy and contracting. Seeking new 
opportunities. Holds an available NOC and a valid driving 
license. Contact: 74069527, email: boutinahocine4616@
gmail.com

CIVIL ENGINEER UPDA CERTIFIED Having 9+ Years 
experience in Qatar Government Projects - Qatar Energy 
Maintenance, Infrastructure, Kahramaa Projects and 
Commercial Buildings, Expert in Project planning, 
management& execution. Qatar driving license available 
& transferable visa. Please contact - 66988132, Email: 
v.sudmn@gmail.com

MECHANICAL ENGINEER INDIAN  With 9 Years 
Experience in Water  Treatment Plants Ro,Dm,Wtp, 
Domestic Purification And Having Experience In Service 
Manager  With Technical Knowledge  Coordination And 
Communication Skills In Daily Operations.  Having Valid 
QID With NOC. Can Join Immediately. Email: 
connectoden93@gmail.com / Call: 77479210.

FINANCE AND CREDIT MANAGER with sound 
experiwnce in the field is looking for suitable position. 
Contact: 33463000, email: mousa_mohd@hotmail.com

PROJECT MANAGER (CIVIL) UPDA Grade A. Having 
more than 25 years abroad experience. Worked for 
interior fit out prestigious projects like Palaces, Malls & 
executive villas.  Having valid QID & driving license, 
ready to join immediately. Contact: 55708492, email: 
arv63259@gmail.com

CFO, SENIOR FINANCE MANAGER with over 17 years 
of work experience in Group Finance across various 
industries & sector in Qatar. MBA Professional with work 
experience in Engineering, Contracting & Trading, Real 
Estate & FnB Division. Have valid NOC & Qatar Driving 
License. Contact me at email: surabiabi@hotmail.com / 
Mobile: 66216411.

EXPERIENCED 3D VISUALISER, interior designer, 
Exterior designer and Events and booth designer with 11 
years of experience in Qatar. Specializing in residential, 
commercial, and luxury projects with a strong portfolio. 
Proficient in 3D Max,Autocad,V_ray,D5 render,Photoshop. 
Seeking new opportunities to collaborate on exciting 
projects. Available for full-time, freelance, or consultancy 
roles. Contact: Email: anshadashraf283@gmail.com, 
Phone: +974 55872890.

ACCOUNTANT: INDIAN MALE, MBA finance, B.com with 
9+ years of experience in GCC and in India. Expertise in 
AP,AR, Banking, WPS, finalization and Vat. Good 
knowledge in Tally, MS office. Can join immediately, 
having transferable Visa. Mob: 50102840, johnbright55@
gmail.com.

ASSISTANT SALES MANAGER. 26 years of experience 
in sales and marketing, with a deep knowledge of 
building materials,joinery,paints, wood items, plywood, 
carpentry products, power tools, and other related 
products. A transferable visa is available. Mob.30081498/ 
sulfisha2000@gmail.com

ADMIN JOB/TEACHER/Document Controller Indian 
Female having 4 years of experience in teaching field.
Looking for job in Admin, Teaching..Visa status: Visit 
Visa.. Contact: sreedivya2mentor@gmail.com, 
Mob:50196340 Available to join immediately

SR.QA/QC ENGINEER - Civil Engineer, ISO Lead Auditor 
and MMUP/UPDA Certified, Having 11years of Gulf 
Experience (Buildings & Infrastructure). Transferable 
Visa with NOC and Driving License. (Immediate Joiner) 
Email: nn.ayaan@gmail.com; Mob:30391390.

LOOKING FOR SUITABLE OPPORTUNITIES. MBA in 
International business & Finance possessing 3 years of 
experience in Qatar. Well versed in AP, AR, WPS, 
Budget,Cash flow & MIS report & Analysis .Proficient in 
Oracle,Oracle-JD Edwards,Microsoft AX 
Dynamics,Microsoft 365 Business Central ,Sage Peach 
Tree. Holds driving license & QID. Mob:77813936. 
Email:Farhanbinumer@gmail.com

SALES EXECUTIVE with 5 year Experience in qatar 
market with oil and gas companies. 26 year old indian, 
good knowledge about building materials, safety items 
and scaffolding. Valid Qatar id and license. Direct contact 
with oil and gas project companies, A, B grade civil and 
MEP company’s . Noc available, ready to join any time. 
Contact - 30784123, email. hishamfadhil@gmail.com

DYNAMIC MARKETING PROFESSIONAL with a 
Bachelor’s in Business Administration and leadership 
experience. Seeking growth-oriented opportunities to 
leverage marketing, team-building, and strategic skills. 
Transferable Resident Permit. Contact 66996610, 
hamadhkola@gmail.com

INDIAN MALE with 8 years’ Experience in Carpentry, 
Painting and Steel fixing. Speaks Hindi, English and 
Arabic. Looking for immediate job. Transferable Visa. 
Mob.: 71242887. Email: taukirhusain3@gmail.com  

Vacancy for Calibration /Instrumentation Technician 

for calibration Lab in Qatar.

Candidates with Valid Visa and NOC is required.

Contact 44763755, tojosanto@gmail.com

Qatari Partner wants to open a company

 in interior design looking for interior 
designer for a joint venture partner. 

Contact Justine 70580098

justine.pj595@gmail.com

URGENTLY REQUIRED
A well reputed company in Qatar is looking to 

fill the below positions urgently

Position Qualification

FIRE ALARM SYSTEM 
TECHNICIAN – 10 NOS
with 2 to 5 Years experience 

Diploma/ITI

FIRE FIGHTING SYSTEM 
TECHNICIAN – 8 NOS 
with 2 to 5 Years experience 

Diploma/ITI

ACCESS CONTROL 
TECHNICIAN - 4 NOS
with Access control system experience with 
2 to 5 Years experience 

Diploma/ITI

All candidates must have transferable VISA/NOC

Interested candidates can email their CV's at 
sibjobs2023@gmail.com 

mentioned position in the subject line

Shortlisted candidates will receive a confirmation 
of schedule interview call or mail

A Leading Company in Qatar is 
seeking for a suitable/ qualified 

candidate for the following position: 

Security Patrolling Supervisor
(Male) Any Nationality

• 2 Years Experience in the same field
• Must have valid Qatari driving license
• Proficiency in spoken and written English
• Willingness to transfer sponsorship

Please e-mail your CV’s at
admin@psecco.com/ shenin@psecco.com 
or kindly contact Mobile No. 30653016 / 70696958

INTERNATIONAL MARITIME W.L.L ANNOUNCES THAT

Is leaving the company for good. Anybody 

having any claims against him should be 

Submit the same to us within 2 days of 

this notice. No claims whatsoever shall be 

entertained after this period.

MR. RASHEED PALLI PARAMBIL
HOLDER OF INDIAN  PASSPORT NO. Y4226141, QATAR ID NO. 26635600798

TEL: 40323800, FAX: 44688733, SPONSOR: 55544665

GULF TIMES CLASSIFIED ADVERTISEMENT
 Corrections or amendments of text, 

change of size or cancellation of an ad once booked 
should be done, before 12:00 Noon.



AT YOUR SERVICE 
DAILY FOR THREE MONTHS

AL MUFTAH RENT-A-CAR Main office D-Ring Rd. T: 4463 4444, 4401 0700
Airport 4463 4433..Al khor 4411 3344..Leasing 5589 1334...Em: reservations@rentacardoha.com...www.rentacardoha.com

AL SAAD RENT A CAR Head Office-Bldg: 242, C-Ring Road T: 4444 9300
Branch-Barwa village, Bldg #17, shop #19........T: 4415 4414, ...M: 3301 3547

AVIS RENT A CAR Al Nasr Holding Co. Building, Bldg. 84, St. 820, Zone 40
T: 4466 7744 F: 4465 7626 Airport T: 4010 8887 Em:avis@qatar.net.qa, www.avisqatar.com

THOUSANDS RENT A CAR
Bldg No 3, Al Andalus Compound, D-ring Rd..T. 44423560, 44423562 M: 5551 4510 F: 44423561

BUDGET RENT A CAR Competitive rates for car rental & leasing 
Main Office T: 4432 5500...M: 6697 1703. Toll Free: 800 4627, Em: info@budgetqatar.com

CAR HIRE

ISO / HACCP CONSULTANTS

QATAR DESIGN CONSORTIUM - ISO 9001, 14001, 45001, 39001, 27001, 22301, 41001, etc.
T: 4419 1777 F: 4443 3873 M: 5540 6516 ...................Em: jenson@qdcqatar.net

TRANSLATION SERVICES

ASIA TRANSLATION SERVICES  www.asiatranslationcenter.com
Sofitel Complex, 1st Floor...T: 44364555, 4029 1307, 44440943 Em:asiatranslation@gmail.com

AL MUFTAH GENERAL SERVICES www.rentacardoha.com
T: 4463 4444/ 4401 0700....M: 5554 2067, 5582 3100....Em:reservations@rentacardoha.com

REAL ESTATEBUS RENTAL / HIRE CARGO SERVICES

AMBASSADOR CARGO D2D worldwide, Intl frieght, packing, relocation 
storage & all logistic support..T: 4437 3338..M: 5500 8857..Em: info@ambassadorcargo.com

GOODWILL CARGO Air, Sea & Land Cargo Services Worldwide Door to Door
Packing & Moving T: 4462 6549, 4487 8448..M: 3318 8200, 3311 2400..Em: sales@goodwillcargoqatar.com

CAPITAL CLEANING CO. W.L.L. All type of Cleaning Services-Reasonable Rates
T: 44582257, 44582546 F: 44582529  M: 33189899 Em: capitalcleaningwll@gmail.com

CLEANING

PEST CONTROL & CLEANING

QATAR PEST CONTROL COMPANY
T: 44222888 M: 55517254, 66590617 F: 44368727, Em:qatarpest@qatar.net.qa

DOHA PEST CONTROL & CLEANING CO. W.L.L. 
T: 4470 9777.. M: 5551 3862, 5551 4709..F: 4436 0838...Em: sales@dohapest.com
NEW INDEX PEST CONTROL & CLEANING
M: 3346 8777 / 7771 3256 .................... Em: info@newindexqatar.com

AT YOUR      SERVICE

Q MASTER W.L.L. 15/26/30/65 Seater Buses with / W-out Driver
Contact  # 55853618, 55861541 (24 Hours) F: 44425610 Em: qataroffice@yahoo.com

THOUSANDS TRANSPORT 60/67 Seated A/C non AC Buses w/ w-out driver
T: 4418 0042...F: 4418 0042...M: 5587 5266...Em: sales@thousandstransport.com

TRAVELLER TRANSPORT - 13/22/26/36/66 Seater Bus With & Without Driver. 
Tel: 44513283 Mob: 30777432 / 55899097. Email: info@travellertransport.com

HIPOWER TRANSPORT: 13/22/26/66 Seater Buses & Pickups with & without driver. 
Tel: 4468 1056, Mob: 5581 1381, 7049 5406, ...... Em: hipower@safarigroup.net

BUSINESS SOLUTION

QATAR ASPECT WLL Business Setup, Local Sponsor, CR License, PRO Service
Call.............................. T: 77912119 .................Em: info@qataraspect.com

Updated on1st & 16th of Every Month

1500/-QRS. 


